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	F Managing Editor 14 FE <editor.14@sciencedomain.org>



	Re: Journal change : 2023/JAMMR/101658
1 message



	Accounts Dept. ME20 <EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org>
	Sat, Nov 18, 2023 at 5:45 PM

	To: Hosea Hamafyelto <hamafyeltohosea@gmail.com>
Cc: Editor publication7 <publication.7@sciencedomain.org>, F Managing Editor 14 FE <EDITOR.14@sciencedomain.org>

		Dear Dr. Hosea Hamafyelto,
 
Thank you for your mail. As per your request, we are inclined to process your manuscript for  Asian Journal of Research in Infectious Diseases. By following the “portability of peer review comments” policy, your manuscript and peer review comments will be transferred to the Editor of Asian Journal of Research in Infectious Diseases  . No fresh peer review will be done and no unnecessary delay will take place in this process. Now we are sending all the files to the editor of  Asian Journal of Research in Infectious Diseases  for his editorial decision. We are waiting for his reply.  Thanks for your kind cooperation and understanding.
 
  
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-MP

On Sat, Nov 18, 2023 at 5:01 PM Hosea Hamafyelto <hamafyeltohosea@gmail.com> wrote:
I accept your offer. I choose Asian journal of research and infectious diseases.


On Sat, Nov 18, 2023, 6:23 AM Accounts Dept. ME20 <EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Hosea Hamafyelto,
 
Thank you for your reply. Kindly note that you can transfer your manuscript 2023/JAMMR/101658 to other Journals with a Higher discount on E-Journal Price. Some recommendations are mentioned below with discount and publication charge: 
 
	Journal names
	Discount
	Publication Charge

	International Journal of TROPICAL DISEASE & Health
	86%
	USD70

	Asian Journal of Research in Infectious Diseases
	94%
	USD30

	International STD Research & Reviews
	95%
	USD25

	Asian Journal of Advanced Research and Reports
	94%
	USD30


 
Kindly let us know your decision on which journal you want to prefer so that we can proceed further. By following the “portability of peer review comments” policy, your manuscript and peer review comments will be transferred to the editor of the Journal of your choice. No fresh peer review will be done and no unnecessary delay will take place in this process. 
 
We are waiting for your response.   
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-OL

On Fri, Nov 17, 2023 at 7:55 PM Hosea Hamafyelto <hamafyeltohosea@gmail.com> wrote:
Sir/Ma,
                  Apology letter 
I want to tell you that I can't afford to publish this paper due to financial reasons. The order time I asked whether a weaver can given you said and I said the exchange rate from naira to dollar is much.
I wish to withdraw this manuscript from your journal due to the above reason.
This paper as not being publish in any journal but local or international.
Thank you

Best regards.


On Wed, Nov 15, 2023, 6:40 AM Accounts Dept. ME20 <EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Hosea Hamafyelto,
 
An invoice of (USD100) for online payment (publication charge) through PayPal has been forwarded to your recommended email id [hamafyeltohosea@gmail.com]. Please check your inbox.
 
Kindly note you’ll find the “View and Pay Invoice” option in the invoice sent to your Email id by PayPal. You need to click on that option to complete the payment formalities.
 
You can complete the payment using this link also: https://www.paypal.com/invoice/p/#NGGWFLUHA9X3UXMV
 
We’ll proceed with publication immediately after the completion of payment formalities. Therefore, you are requested to complete the payment.
 
Should you need any assistance please do not hesitate to contact us.
 
Hope to hear from you soon. 
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-SL
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