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	Accounts Dept. ME20 <EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org>
	Wed, Jun 4, 2025 at 1:13 PM

	To: Mr-nice <johnsimon3110@gmail.com>
Cc: Editor Galley Proof 3 <publication.3@sciencedomain.org>, Managing Editor FE <sdi.7@sciencedomain.org>

		Dear Dr. Simon John,
 
Thank you for your mail. As per your request, we are inclined to process your manuscript for  Asian Journal of Research in Computer Science  (AJRCoS). By following the “portability of peer review comments” policy, your manuscript and peer review comments will be transferred to the Editor of  Asian Journal of Research in Computer Science     ( AJRCoS ). No fresh peer review will be done and no unnecessary delay will take place in this process. Now we are sending all the files to the editor of  Asian Journal of Research in Computer Science   ( AJRCoS) for his editorial decision. We are waiting for his reply.  

Thanks for your kind cooperation and understanding.
   
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-AS

On Wed, Jun 4, 2025 at 2:26 AM Mr-nice <johnsimon3110@gmail.com> wrote:

Subject: Request to Change Journal Option Due to Processing Fee
Dear Sir/Ma,
Good day. I hope this message finds you well.
I am writing to kindly request a change in my journal submission option. I apologize for any inconvenience caused, but after computing the processing fee, I found it to be quite high for me.
Therefore, I would like to switch my submission to the Asian Journal of Research in Computer Science, where the processing fee is more affordable for me with a 94% discount, it amounts to just 30 USD.
Thank you for your understanding and support.
Best regards

On Tue, Jun 3, 2025, 2:14 PM Accounts Dept. ME20 <EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org> wrote:
Dear Dr. Simon John,
 
We have sent you an important communication related to your paper. Please check your inbox/bulk folder/junk folder etc. carefully. If you have not received the email, please contact us immediately. 
 
Subject line of the email is
 
“Request for payment regarding Manuscript Number: 2025/CJAST/136717”
 
Have you received that mail please?
 
 
This mail has been sent from following 3 emails to avoid email delivery failure:
 
1.       EDITOR.20@sciencedomain.org
2.    editor.20@sciencedomain.uk
3.    editor.20@sciencedomain.info
 
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal editorial office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 |
+91 9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708 UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
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